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Sun 일 Mon 월 Tue화 Wed수 Thu목 Fri 금 cSat토 

 
The tomb is empty! 

1 
Pray for NK 
workers in other 
countries to have 
safe conditions 
and receive their 
pay regularly. 

2 
Pray for negotiations 
to end the war in the 
Ukraine and that all 
troops be able to 
return to their 
homes. 

3 
 Pray for a unified 
Korean people, 
North and South to 
be able to come 
together in the Lord 
with the people of 
China and Japan. 

4 
Pray for the Holy Spirit 
to be poured out on the 
worship and prayer 
time at the Three Seas 
Center every Friday 
night and people draw 
closer to the Lord and 
each other. 

5 
Pray for wisdom in 
considering how to 
make Phase 2 of the 
Three Seas 
Construction plan 
more affordable and 
feasible. 

6 
The LORD is my 
strength and 
song, and he is 
become my 
salvation: Ex. 15:2a 

7 
May the leadership of 
North Korea come to 
understand that their 
salvation is not in 
weapons but in the 
Lord. 

8 
Pray for those who 
suffer abuse in the 
military and other 
areas of life in North 
Korea. 

9 
Pray for the NK 
Association meeting 
today and tomorrow as 
reps from various 
organizations gather to 
discuss collaboration. 

10 
Pray for new and 
creative approaches to 
engaging North Korea 
by South Korea and 
the United States. 

11 
Pray for the Fourth 
River Team 
continuing to 
evaluate program 
needs and methods.  

12 
Pray that the Board of 
Directors of the Fourth 
River Corp. have 
God’s wisdom as they 
consider new possib-
ilities for the future.   

13 
But unto you that 
fear my name shall 
the Sun of right-
eousness arise with 
healing in his 
wings.  Mal. 4:2 

14 
May the leadership 
of North Korea 
allow freedom of 
access to 
information and 
travel. 

15 
Great Sun Day 

Birthday of  
Kim Il Sung 

May the people know 
the true Sun of 
Righteousness. 

16 
Pray that that foreign 
art groups be invited 
to participate in the 
art festival in 
Pyongyang this 
week.  

17 
Pray that lovers of 
Jesus Christ be 
raised up around the 
world to bring His 
love into North 
Korea. 

Good Friday  18 
Pray for the Three Seas 
Community as they 
take time to reflect on 
their personal and 
communal life and 
mission this Good 
Friday. 

Holy Saturday 19 
Pray that as the 
community of Jesus 
Abbey celebrates the 
lighting of the New 
Fire tonight, the light of 
Christ shine brightly 
from there. 

20 
Feast of the 

Resurrection! 
He is not here: for 
he is risen, as he 

said. Come, see… 
Matthew 28:6 

21 
Kang Pan-sok’s 

Birthday 
(Kim Il Sung’s 

mother) 
May her Christian faith 

become that of her 
great-grandson. 

22 
Pray for all the 
people of North 
Korea to come to 
know their savior, 
the risen Christ. 

23 
Pray that intercessors 
around the world 
praying for North 
Korea be encouraged 
and intercede for the 
salvation of the 
people. 

24 
Pray for God to 
raise up more 
intercessors 
throughout South 
Korea to pray for 
the North. 

25 
Korean People’s 

Army Foundation 
Day  

May peace and 
security be founded 

on God 

26 
Pray for the Fourth 
River team teaching 
on the Holy Spirit 
next week at the 
University of the 
Nations in Jeju. 

27 
LORD, You will 
establish peace for 
us, Since You have 
also performed for 
us all our works. 
Is. 26:12 

28 
May the leadership 
of NK open the 
borders again to 
foreign tourists, 
business workers 
and NGOs 

29 
Pray for the people 
of North Korea to 
get over the “spring 
hump” well as they 
wait for the first 
harvests to come in. 

30 
Pray that 
humanitarian and 
Christian NGOs be 
able to bring medical 
and food aid into 
North Korea.  

 

 
Great Sun Day 

 
Spring in 

Gaemagowon, 
North Korea 

The Fourth River Project: Preparing for the opening of North Korea 
At the Three Seas Center 

A place of preparation through prayer, labor and instruction. 
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